
NORTH BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP COUNCIL
 

REGULAR MEETING AGENDA
710 HERMAN ROAD
NORTH BRUNSWICK, NEW JERSEY 

March 1, 2021
7:00 PM

1. Call to Order, Roll Call and Cell Phone Statement

2. Sunshine Notice

3. Pledge of Allegiance

4. Consent Agenda

a. NJ State Fireman's Association Application / Jason D. Smith /
Fire Co. #3

b. 78-3.21 Authorizing acceptance of a Grant from Middlesex County
regarding its Helping Hand Grant Program

c. 79-3.21 Authorizing the acceptance of the Sale of Auctioned
Abandoned Motor Vehicles

d. 80-3.21 Authorizing an application and acceptance of a Grant from the
State of New Jersey Division of Highway Traffic Safety

e. 81-3.21 Amending the Contract with In-Line Services, Inc. for the
purchase and installation of Water Meters

f. 82-3.21 Authorizing a Change In Scope to the PSA with CME
Associates appointed as the 2021 Township Consulting
Engineering Firm to include Construction Administration
Phase Services for the Livingston Avenue Sewer Main
Replacement Project

g. 83-3.21 Bill List

5. Approval of minutes

a. Minutes / Regular Council Meeting / February 8, 2021
b. Minutes / Regular Council Meeting / February 16, 2021

6. Ordinances / First Reading / Introduction:

a. An Ordinance amending Chapter 356 of the Code of the Township of
North Brunswick entitled Wreckers Section 356-20 Application and
License Fees, and Section 356-21 Rates for Towing and Storage Services

7. Reports from Mayor, Council, Administrator, CFO

8. Public Hearing

9. Adjourn



NORTH BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP
Agenda Item - 4.b.

Authorizing acceptance of a Grant from Middlesex County regarding its Helping Hand Grant
Program

Resolution Number:  78-3.21

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Reso Cover Memo







NORTH BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP
Agenda Item - 4.c.

Authorizing the acceptance of the Sale of Auctioned Abandoned Motor Vehicles

Resolution Number:  79-3.21

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Reso Cover Memo



Resolution # ________ 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWNSHIP COUNCIL OF NORTH BRUNSWICK 

AUTHORIZING THE ACCEPTANCE OF THE SALE OF 

AUCTIONED ABANDONED MOTOR VEHICLES 

 

WHEREAS, on February 1, 2021, Resolution 68-2.21, authorized the sale of a municipally 
owned abandoned and/or unclaimed motor vehicle by public auction, as set forth on the attached 
document; and  

 
WHEREAS, notice of said auction was duly advertised in the Home News & Tribune on 

February 5, 2021; and 
 
WHEREAS, bids were received Friday, February 19, 2021, and quotes were solicited after 

the close of auction if no bids were submitted. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, on this 1st day of March 2021, by the 

Township Council of the Township of North Brunswick, that the respective bid and/or quote set 
forth herein on the attached document are hereby accepted.  

 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that upon payment in full for the balance of the amount 

due, the Clerk is hereby authorized to execute the appropriate documents to transfer the title for said 
motor vehicle to the successful respondent.  
 
______________________    ______________________ 
Cavel Gallimore     Joseph A. Battaglia 
Chief Financial Officer    Police Chief  
 
______________________                                    _______________________ 
Justine Progebin     Ronald Gordon, Esq. 
Business Administrator    Township Attorney 
       Approved as to legal form 
 
 

RECORDED VOTE: 

COUNCIL MEMBER YES NO  ABSTAIN  NOTES 

CORTES     

LOPEZ     

GUADAGNINO     

ANDREWS     

DAVIS     

SOCIO     

MAYOR WOMACK     
 
I hereby certify that the above Resolution was duly adopted by the Township Council of the 
Township of North Brunswick, County of Middlesex, at its meeting held on March 1, 2021. 
 
_____________________ 
Lisa Russo 
Township Clerk 



Public Sale of Abandoned Vehicles Township of North Brunswick

Public Auction Held 2/19/2021 710 Hermann Road 

Quotes due 2/19/2021 North Brunswick, NJ 08902

AD # Year Make Model Vin Location Bid Bidder Quote Bidder

1 2006 Honda Odyssey 5FNRL38426B090446 Logans 500.00       Marvin N/A

2 2009 Hyundai Sante Fe 5NMSG13D69H249277 Logans 650.00       Mike's Auto N/A

3 2004 GMC Envoy 1GKDT13S342190337 Logans no bid 176.00        Jersey One

4 2005 Honda Civic 1HGEM22525L039789 Logans 500.00       Marvin N/A

5 2013 Ford Escape 1FMCU0GX9DUD84438 Logans 500.00       Marvin N/A

6 2008 Honda Civic 2HGFG12818H550993 Richs 700.00       Jersey One N/A

7 1996 Acura Integra JH4DC4363TS014143 Richs no bid 376.00        Jersey One

8 2003 Ford Taurus 1FAHP56S73A228876 Richs no bid 391.00        Mikes Auto

9 2002 Honda Civic 1HGEM22052L015275 Richs no bid 388.00        Jersey One

10 1995 Ford F-150 1FTEX14H3SKB54832 Richs no bid 431.00        Jersey One

11 1999 Ford F-350 1FTSX30SXXED95373 Richs 725.00       Mike's Auto N/A

12 1993 Ford F-150 1FTDF15Y2PLB20718 Coppas no bid 375.00        Mikes Auto

13 2003 Honda Accord 1HGCM82733A012900 Coppas 650.00       Coppas N/A

Total: 4,225.00     2,137.00       



NORTH BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP
Agenda Item - 4.d.

Authorizing an application and acceptance of a Grant from the State of New Jersey Division of
Highway Traffic Safety

Resolution Number:  80-3.21

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Reso Cover Memo













NORTH BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP
Agenda Item - 4.e.

Amending the Contract with In-Line Services, Inc. for the purchase and installation of Water Meters

Resolution Number:  81-3.21

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Reso Cover Memo



Resolution #_________________ 

A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWNSHIP OF NORTH BRUNSWICK 

AMENDING THE CONTRACT WITH IN-LINE SERVICES, INC.  

FOR THE PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF WATER METERS 

 
 

WHEREAS, a water meter is a device located within a dwelling that measures the 
volume of water consumed; and  

 
 WHEREAS, the Township is the owner of the approximate 12,000 water meters that are 

part of the water distribution system; and   
 

WHEREAS, in January of 2018, the Mayor created a Water Ad Hoc Committee to begin 
reviewing the condition of the water system; and 

 
WHEREAS, the Committee determined it is the best interest of the Township to replace 

the meters, most of which are approximately 20 years old and had exceeded their useful life, 
along with installing an automated system, that will enable the Township to efficiently provide 
customers monthly billing, online access to their water consumption, and usage alerts to curtail a 
resident receiving an unanticipated high water bill; and  
 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Public Contract Law N.J.S.A. 40A:11-13(d) et seq. and 
N.J.A.C. 5:34-9.1 the Township may authorize the advertisement for bids for goods and services 
on a proprietary basis, provided that the goods are of a specialized nature and necessary for the 
conduct of the affairs of the local unit; and  

 
WHEREAS, after extensive investigation and research of meter systems, and having 

interviewed potential vendors, the Water Ad Hoc Committee determined that there was a need 
for a proprietary water meter system and software (Neptune Mach 10 R900i Ultrasonic E-Coder 
& TRU/FLO Compound Meters and R900 system Data Collection Hardware & Software); and 

 
WHEREAS, on June 4, 2018, pursuant to Resolution 157-6.18, the Governing Body 

authorized the advertisement for the receipt of bids for the purchase and installation water meters 
as a proprietary contract; and  

 
WHEREAS, on June 4, 2018, pursuant to Resolution 158-6.18, the Governing Body 

authorized the Township to file a loan application with the New Jersey Water Bank for funding 
this project; and  
 

WHEREAS, on March 7, 2019, T&M Associates, engineers for this project, was notified 
that the New Jersey Water Bank approved the application to fund this project; and  
 

WHEREAS, the aggregate of the goods and services requested was anticipated to exceed 
the current bid threshold, and therefore required to be bid under a formal process pursuant to 
Local Public Contract Law, N.J.S.A. 40A:11-3 et seq.; and 

 
WHEREAS, on March 18, 2019  the Township Council approved Resolution 104-3.19 

authorizing advertisement for receipt of bids for the Purchase and Installation of Water Meters, 
Contract BID19004; and  



Resolution #_________________ 

WHEREAS, the Municipal Clerk witnessed the receipt of three bids on April 11, 2019 
and the lowest qualifying bid was submitted by In-Line Services Inc. of Flemington, NJ with a 
base bid of $5,426,404.50 for Items 1 through 17, plus $217,600.00 for the Alternate (Software), 
for a total bid of $5,644,004.50; and  

 
WHEREAS, on May 20, 2019, pursuant to Resolution 157-5.19, the Governing Body 

authorized the award of Contract BID19004 to In-Line Services Inc. in the amount of 
$5,644,004.50; and 

 
WHEREAS, for this project as bid, all commercial meters that were originally believed 

to be compound or HP turbine meters and upon a site survey from the contractor it was found 
that many of the commercial meters were instead Protectus meters, which resulted in a change to  
the amount originally bid; and  

 
WHEREAS, in October of 2019, reduction Change Order No. 1 was issued in the 

amount of -$38,630.98, for a revised contract amount of $5,605,373.02; and 
 
WHEREAS, for this project as bid, all residential meters were originally to be replaced 

with a Mach-10 meter, which required a 3-wire connection between the meter and the 
transmitter. However, it was found that some of the existing meters utilized a 2-wire system and 
were unable to be rewired based on the construction of the home. As a result, a recommendation 
was made to exchange the Mach-10 model meter for a T-10 model meter with a grounding 
adapter plate to achieve the same result; and  

 
WHEREAS, T&M Associates has reviewed and hereby recommends approval of 

Change Order No. 2 in the amount of $11,591.75, for a revised contract amount of 
$5,616,964.77; and 

 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that Change Order No. 2 with In-Line 

Services Inc. is hereby accepted. 
 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, Township Council of the Township of North 
Brunswick does hereby authorize the Mayor or Administrator to execute Change Order No. 2 
with In-Line Services Inc. for T-10 model meters with adapter plates, in the amount of 
$11,591.75, for a revised contract amount of $5,616,964.77 

 
 

CERTIFICATION 
 
I, Cavel Gallimore, Chief Financial Officer of the Township of North Brunswick, certify that 
funds in the following account totaling $11,591.75 are available under Contract BID19004: 
 
$11,591.75 are available in the FY2019 Water Capital account C-06-55-C19-191-101. 
 
 
_____________________     
Cavel Gallimore       
Chief Financial Officer    
 



Resolution #_________________ 

 
_____________________      ________________________ 
Justine Progebin     Ronald Gordon, Esq. 
Business Administrator    Township Attorney 

Approved as to Legal Form 
 
 
RECORDED VOTE: 
COUNCIL MEMBER YES NO  ABSTAIN  NOTES 

CORTES     

LOPEZ     

GUADAGNINO     

ANDREWS     

DAVIS     

SOCIO     

MAYOR WOMACK     
 
 
I hereby certify that the above Resolution was duly adopted by the Township Council of the 
Township of North Brunswick, County of Middlesex, at its meeting held on March 1, 2021. 
 
 
_____________________ 
Lisa Russo 
Township Clerk 
 
 





























NORTH BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP
Agenda Item - 4.f.

Authorizing a Change In Scope to the PSA with CME Associates appointed as the 2021 Township
Consulting Engineering Firm to include Construction Administration Phase Services for the
Livingston Avenue Sewer Main Replacement Project

Resolution Number:  82-3.21

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Reso Cover Memo



Resolution #____________ 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWNSHIP COUNCIL OF NORTH BRUNSWICK 
AUTHORIZING A CHANGE IN SCOPE TO  

THE PROFESSIONAL SERVICE AGREEMENT WITH CME ASSOCIATES 
APPOINTED AS THE 2021 TOWNSHIP CONSULTING ENGINEERING FIRM  

TO INCLUDE CONSTRUCTION ADMINISTRATION PHASE SERVICES FOR THE  
LIVINGSTON AVENUE SEWER MAIN REPLACEMENT PROJECT 

 
WHEREAS, the Township is the owner of the Municipal Sewer Distribution System that 

includes main sewer lines that run under Livingston Avenue that conveys wastewater to the 
Middlesex County Utility Authority (MCUA) for processing; and  
 

WHEREAS, the New Jersey Department of Transportation (NJDOT) owns and maintains 
Route 26, known in North Brunswick as Livingston Avenue; and 

 

WHEREAS, when NJDOT notified the Township of their plans to mill and pave a section 
of Livingston Avenue, from Yorke Road to Nassau Street in 2021, the Township reviewed the 
condition of the municipal water and sewer lines under the roadway to make sure any necessary 
repairs were made prior to the commencement of work by NJDOT; and   
 
 WHEREAS, based on necessary improvements needed, the total Project will include 
improvements of the sanitary sewer and water main along Livingston Avenue, from How Lane to 
Nassau Street. The proposed improvements for the Sanitary Sewer portion of the Project generally 
consists of restoration to the existing 8”-12” sanitary clay piping, by replacing approximately 1,631 
linear feet (LF) from Jerome Place to Nassau Street, and installing structural lining for 
approximately 4,268 LF from How Lane to Jerome Place. Not included within the NJ I-Bank 
Finance Application, the project will also include water main improvements. 
 

WHEREAS, the Township of North Brunswick filed a loan application with the New Jersey 
Department of Environmental Protection (NJDEP) for Finance Assistance through the New Jersey 
Infrastructure Bank (NJ I-Bank) Financing Program for the Sanitary Sewer portion of the Project; 
and  

WHEREAS, in December of 2019, pursuant to Resolution 331-12.19, CME Associates was 
engaged to provide professional services associated with the Livingston Avenue Sewer Line 
Replacement Project in the amount of $65,069.00 for survey, design and permitting services; and   

 
WHEREAS, CME Associates has been requested to provide a proposal for construction 

phase services for the services associated with the Livingston Avenue Sewer Line Replacement 
Project; and  

 
WHEREAS, in January of 2021, pursuant to Resolution 10-1.21, CME Associates, of 3141 

Bordentown Avenue, Parlin, NJ 08959, was authorized to provide engineering consulting services 
for calendar year 2021, as awarded under a fair and open contract process, pursuant to the 
provisions of N.J.S.A. 19:44A-20.1 et seq.; and 
 

WHEREAS, CME Associates current agreement includes the following:  
 

General engineering services in an amount not-to-exceed $100,000.00, and 
Professional services associated with the Mile Run Interceptor Rehabilitation Project, in  
the amount of $143,434.00, for a revised contract authorization amount of $243,434.00 
 

Amendment 1 



Resolution #____________ 
 

WHEREAS, compensation for requested services associated with the Livingston Avenue 
Sewer Line Replacement Project shall be based upon the February 17, 2021 proposal submitted by 
CME Associates, to be paid upon submission of monthly invoices, for an estimated cost not-to-
exceed $216,000.00, and a revised contract authorization amount of $459,434.00. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED on this 1st day of March 2021, that the 
Township Council of the Township of North Brunswick does hereby authorize the Mayor to 
execute and the Township Clerk to witness an amendment to the current agreement with CME 
Associates, to include construction phase services associated with the Livingston Avenue Sewer 
Line Replacement Project for an estimated cost not-to-exceed $216,000.00, and a revised contract 
authorization amount of $459,434.00; and 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED notice of this action shall be published in the Home News 
& Tribune as required by law within 10 (ten) days after its passage 

 
 

CERTIFICATION 
 

I, Cavel Gallimore, Chief Financial Officer of the Township of North Brunswick, hereby certify that 
funds in the following account totaling $216,000.00 are available under Contract PRO21036: 
 

$  34,920.27 are available in the FY2019 Sewer Capital 18-12 account C-08-55-C19-181-901, 
$  80,000.00 are available in the FY2020 Sewer Capital 19-08 account C-08-55-C19-191-901, and 
$101,079.73 are available in the FY2021 Sewer Capital 19-22 account C-08-55-C20-190-901. 
 
_____________________    _____________________    
Cavel Gallimore     Eric Chaszar      
Chief Financial Officer    Director of Public Works 
 
__________________                            _____________________ 
Justine Progebin     Ronald Gordon, Esq. 
Business Administrator    Township Attorney 
       Approved as to legal form 
 

RECORDED VOTE: 

COUNCIL MEMBER YES NO  ABSTAIN  NOTES 

CORTES     

LOPEZ     

GUADAGNINO     

ANDREWS     

DAVIS     

SOCIO     

MAYOR WOMACK     
 
I hereby certify that the above Resolution was duly adopted by the Township Council of the 
Township of North Brunswick, County of Middlesex, at its meeting held on March 1, 2021. 
 
_____________________ 
Lisa Russo 
Township Clerk 



 

Installation of structural lining for approximately 4,268 LF from How Lane to Jerome Place 

 

Restoration to the existing 8”‐12” sanitary clay piping, by replacing approximately 1,631 linear 
feet (LF) from Jerome Place to Nassau Street  











NORTH BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP
Agenda Item - 4.g.

Bill List

Resolution Number:  83-3.21

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Bill List Cover Memo
Bill List 2 of 2 Cover Memo















































































NORTH BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP
Agenda Item - 5.a.

Minutes / Regular Council Meeting / February 8, 2021

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Minutes Cover Memo





NORTH BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP
Agenda Item - 5.b.

Minutes / Regular Council Meeting / February 16, 2021

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Minutes Cover Memo









NORTH BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP
Agenda Item - 6.a.

An Ordinance amending Chapter 356 of the Code of the Township of North Brunswick entitled
Wreckers Section 356-20 Application and License Fees, and Section 356-21 Rates for Towing and
Storage Services
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