
Resolution ___________ 

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING A CREDIT OR REFUND TO  

 TOWNSHIP CUSTOMERS 

FOR THEIR WATER-SEWER UTILITY ACCOUNT 
 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Chapter 352-12 of the Township Code – all claims for a deduction from 
sewer/water bills shall be made in writing to the Mayor and Council of the Township of North 
Brunswick which has full power to determine such claims; and  
 
WHEREAS, the following Township customers have requested a refund for the circumstance 
provided:         
                     

Account Explanation Amount Credit/Refund 
6026-0 Pool Credit $248.04 Credit 

14490-0 One-time leak adjustment $483.43 Credit 

17265-0 Overpayment Refund $2,444.59 Refund 

13635-0 One-time leak adjustment $535.14 Credit 
 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, on this 15th day of November 2021, the Township 
Council of the Township of North Brunswick does hereby authorize a refund for the account listed 
herein above. 

 
 
__________________                            _____________________ 
Justine Progebin    Ronald Gordon, Esq. 
Business Administrator   Township Attorney 
      Approved as to legal form 
 
RECORDED VOTE: 

COUNCIL MEMBER YES NO  ABSTAIN  NOTES 

MEHTA     

LOPEZ     

GUADAGNINO     

ANDREWS     

DAVIS     

SOCIO     

MAYOR WOMACK     
 
I hereby certify that the above Resolution was duly adopted by the Township Council of the 
Township of North Brunswick, County of Middlesex, at its meeting held on November 15, 2021. 
 
 
_____________________ 
Lisa Russo 
Township Clerk 
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From: Dan Engel
To: Samantha Gresh
Subject: 100 Princess Dr Water Credit Request
Date: Thursday, November 4, 2021 2:58:56 PM
Attachments: 100 Princess Dr Leak Credit Request 110421.pdf

Samantha,
               Please add this credit request to the upcoming council agenda. It is in the amount of 
$483.43 for 100 Princess Drive Acct# 14490. Thank you.
 
 
Dan Engel
Department of Water and Sewer
Township of North Brunswick
(732) 247-0922 ext. 248
(732) 993-1146 fax
dengel@northbrunswicknj.gov
 

mailto:dengel@northbrunswicknj.gov
mailto:ssickles@northbrunswicknj.gov
mailto:dengel@northbrunswicknj.gov







































From: Dan Engel
To: Samantha Gresh
Subject: FW: Overpaid Water Bill - Request to Return - Account#17265-0
Date: Thursday, November 4, 2021 3:02:29 PM
Attachments: 172650.pdf

Samantha,
               Can you please submit this to council for approval? They had paid the assessment fee of
$2500 by mistake and had the meter installed in the meantime. The $2500 was removed from their
account and they have a credit balance which they would like refunded to them. Thank you.
 
Dan Engel
Department of Water and Sewer
Township of North Brunswick
(732) 247-0922 ext. 248
(732) 993-1146 fax
dengel@northbrunswicknj.gov
 
 
 
From: vishnu patel <vishnuhpatel@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, September 17, 2021 11:00 PM
To: TWPNBwater <TWPNBwater@northbrunswicknj.gov>
Subject: Overpaid Water Bill - Request to Return - Account#17265-0
 
Respected,
 
I paid over assessment charge and I would like to get my money back.   Could you please
review and send me the overpaid amount to my address? Kindly let me know if you need
more details.
 
AccountID : 17265-0
Location : 28 PEMBROOK Ave, North Brunswick Township, NJ 08902
Block/LOT/QUAL :  4.44 2.7328
Overpaid Amount : 2,444.59
 
Attachments
1) 172650.pdf. -  Latest bill from online. This shows the overpaid amount.
2) Bank Transaction for the over paid amount
 
 
 

mailto:dengel@northbrunswicknj.gov
mailto:ssickles@northbrunswicknj.gov
mailto:dengel@northbrunswicknj.gov



MAKE CHECKS PAYABLE TO:


ACCOUNT INFORMATION AMOUNT DUE


ACCOUNT INFORMATION


CURRENT METER ACTIVITY


CURRENT CHARGES DETAIL


AMOUNT DUE


SPECIAL MESSAGE


AMOUNT ENCLOSED


PAYMENT COUPON - PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN THIS PORTION ALONG WITH YOUR PAYMENT


FACILITY FEE CHARGES


1. The Mayor and Council wish to provide continued financial 
assistance to customers of the North Brunswick utility systems and 
have authorized the waiver of any interest, charges or late fees on 
all municipal utility accounts for water and sewer that become 
delinquent during the COVID-19 pandemic and emergency through 
September 30, 2021 (Resolution 145-5.21). 
2. The current bill issued 9/01/2021 will be for consumption from 
7/31/2021 through 8/31/2021 for customers with a new meter.  
3. For old meters, billing will be based on the cut-off date from 
the last time the meter was read. If the meter was unable to be 
read, a bill has been generated based on estimated consumption. 
4. All customers registered with WaterSmart will 
receive notification of unusual water activity through 
email correspondence. All customers are encouraged to sign up with  
WaterSmart to take advantage of this alert system and sign up to 
receive billing statements via email. 
5. More information can be found on the Township's new website 
under "Water Services" at https://northbrunswicknj.gov/ 
departments/administration/water-services/ 
  
  
  
  
 


22.75


3.00


NO BRUNSWICK, NJ 08902


09/01/21


17265-0
LOCATION:


CURRENT READING
07/31/21WATER


BLOCK/LOT/QUAL:


CURRENT CHARGES:


NORTH BRUNSWICK TOWNSHIP


BILLING DATE:


4.44       2.7328


29.66


BLOCK/LOT/QUAL:


DAYS


2,500.00-


METER NUM


SHUKLA, KRISHNAANT


28 PEMBROOK AVENUELOCATION:


2,444.59-


710 HERMANN RD


17265-0


0.00


CREDIT - DO NOT PAY!


55.41


4.44       2.7328


RES FCLTY FEE 5/8"


TOTAL DUE:


DESCRIPTION


DUE DATE:


      32818


2,444.59-


PREVIOUS BALANCE:


BILLING DATE:


SWR CONSUMPTION GAL


1565170376


ACCOUNT NO:


28 PEMBROOK AVENUE


USAGE


TOTAL DUE:


0.00


NORTH BRUNSWICK, NJ 08902


10/01/21


LAST PAYMENT:


08/31/21       37379
Meter Num


DATE: 08/05/21       AMOUNT: 2,920.54ACCOUNT NO:


0.00
WTR CONSUMPTION GAL


      4561


09/01/21


10/01/21


PREVIOUS READING


28 PEMBROOK AVENUE


30


DUE DATE:







 
--
 
Thanks & Regards,
Vishnu Patel
Cell#2018500357
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delinquent during the COVID-19 pandemic and emergency through 
September 30, 2021 (Resolution 145-5.21). 
2. The current bill issued 9/01/2021 will be for consumption from 
7/31/2021 through 8/31/2021 for customers with a new meter.  
3. For old meters, billing will be based on the cut-off date from 
the last time the meter was read. If the meter was unable to be 
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4. All customers registered with WaterSmart will 
receive notification of unusual water activity through 
email correspondence. All customers are encouraged to sign up with  
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From: Dan Engel
To: Samantha Gresh
Subject: 22 Poe Rd Acct#13635 Leak Credit Request
Date: Thursday, November 4, 2021 3:32:30 PM
Attachments: 22 Poe Rd Credit Request 110421.pdf

Samantha,
               Please add this leak adjustment request for 22 Poe rd Acct#13635 to the council agenda for
the amount of $535.14. They had a faulty fill valve in a toilet that was repaired. Thank you.
 
Dan Engel
Department of Water and Sewer
Township of North Brunswick
(732) 247-0922 ext. 248
(732) 993-1146 fax
dengel@northbrunswicknj.gov
 

mailto:dengel@northbrunswicknj.gov
mailto:ssickles@northbrunswicknj.gov
mailto:dengel@northbrunswicknj.gov
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